

FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA
BID 18-0322 Recycle Skid Steers & Forklifts
22 March 2018 - 2:00 PM

Company	Side Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/60" Forks				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery
Thompson Tractor Addendum 1	NO BID					Hyundai 25D-9	29,046.00	795.00	985.00	90 days verbal
✓	NO BID					Hyundai 25D-9	40,100.00	795.00	985.00	90 days verbal
Company	Side Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/60" Forks				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery
Yancey Bros Addendum 1	NO BID					NO BID				
NO	CAT 232D	36,759.00	368.00	942.00	30-45 days	NO BID				
Company	Side Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/60" Forks				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery
Atlanta Kubota Addendum 1	NO BID					NO BID				
✓	Kubota SSV65	35,318.77	950.00	950.00	15-30 days	NO BID				
Company	Side Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/60" Forks				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery
Mid-South Equipment Addendum 1	JCB 215T4	41,000.00	550.00	1,052.00	90 day	NO BID				
✓	NO BID					NO BID				
Company	Side Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/60" Forks				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery
MHI Addendum 1	NO BID					Clark S25	29,439.00	INCL	INCL	112 days
✓	NO BID					Clark S25	35,188.00	INCL	INCL	112 days

Penny Hale
3/22/2018

PAGE 1 OF 2

FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA
 BID 18-0322 Recycle Skid Steers & Forklifts
 22 March 2018 - 2:00 PM

Company	Side Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/60" Forks				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery
Border Equip	NO BID					NO BID				
Addendum 1	Front Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/Bale Clamp				
✓	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty		Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	
	Case SV185	38,000.00	357.00	757.00	90days	NO BID				

Company	Side Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/60" Forks				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery
Advanced Material Handling	NO BID					Hyundai 25D-9	27,124.00	INCL	INCL	110days
Addendum 1	Front Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/Bale Clamp				
✓	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty		Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	
	NO BID					Hyundai 25D-9	33,192.00	INCL	INCL	110days

Company	Side Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/60" Forks				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery
Addendum 1										
	Front Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/Bale Clamp				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty		Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	

Company	Side Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/60" Forks				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery
Addendum 1										
	Front Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/Bale Clamp				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty		Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	

Company	Side Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/60" Forks				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	Delivery
Addendum 1										
	Front Entry Skid Steer					Forklift w/Bale Clamp				
	Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty		Make/Model	Price	3 Yr Ext Warranty	3 Yr B to B Warranty	

Penny Hale 3/22/2018

PAGE 2 OF 2